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There were no air raid sirens. No missiles or bombs. No mushroom clouds. No panic in the streets. The end,
when it came, was like nothing we ever expected.

First hit was a small Gulf Coast city. Seventy thousand dead, just like that. Then Rome. Flags toppled and
nations crumbled, as people began dying by the millions. Soon there would be no one left alive, except for
the lucky few who were genetically immune.

One man—pilot Nick Tesla—knew what was happening. He had survived and escaped the first Zone of
Death. The army has sent him back in, determined to stop the destruction of humanity.

Until Tesla sees reality—a mad scientist, the father of the unknown type of radiation, who perhaps isn’t so
mad at all. When the tables are turned, Tesla decides to push the button and send the world back to the
beginning…so civilization can have a fresh start and avoid all the mistakes of the past.

With a new introduction by Jeff Shaara, the author's son, and a New York Times bestselling novelist in his
own right.
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From reader reviews:

Joseph Bolden:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to find out everything in the world. Each book has different aim as well as goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They can be reading
whatever they have because their hobby is definitely reading a book. What about the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or maybe
exercise. Well, probably you should have this The Herald.

Joseph Wilson:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the name The Herald suitable to
you? The particular book was written by famous writer in this era. Often the book untitled The Heraldis the
main of several books that will everyone read now. This book was inspired many people in the world. When
you read this e-book you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know before. The author explained
their thought in the simple way, consequently all of people can easily to be aware of the core of this e-book.
This book will give you a large amount of information about this world now. To help you to see the
represented of the world on this book.

Gary Forsyth:

Beside this The Herald in your phone, it may give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or
information. The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh through the oven so don't
possibly be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have The Herald
because this book offers to you personally readable information. Do you often have book but you don't get
what it's about. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable
blend here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss that?
Find this book in addition to read it from now!

Teresa Hanson:

This The Herald is new way for you who has intense curiosity to look for some information as it relief your
hunger associated with. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still
having little digest in reading this The Herald can be the light food in your case because the information
inside this particular book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books create itself in the form which can
be reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in guide form make them feel
tired even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there is not any in reading a publication especially this one. You
can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book
variety for your better life and also knowledge.
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