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Mapping class groups and moduli spaces of Riemann surfaces were the topics of the Graduate Summer
School at the 2011 IAS/Park City Mathematics Institute. This book presents the nine different lecture series
comprising the summer school, covering a selection of topics of current interest. The introductory courses
treat mapping class groups and Teichmüller theory. The more advanced courses cover intersection theory on
moduli spaces, the dynamics of polygonal billiards and moduli spaces, the stable cohomology of mapping
class groups, the structure of Torelli groups, and arithmetic mapping class groups. The courses consist of a
set of intensive short lectures offered by leaders in the field, designed to introduce students to exciting,
current research in mathematics. These lectures do not duplicate standard courses available elsewhere. The
book should be a valuable resource for graduate students and researchers interested in the topology,
geometry and dynamics of moduli spaces of Riemann surfaces and related topics.
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From reader reviews:

David Smith:

This Moduli Spaces of Riemann Surfaces (IAS/Park City Mathematics Series) book is just not ordinary
book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is usually
information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper you read a lot of
information you will get. That Moduli Spaces of Riemann Surfaces (IAS/Park City Mathematics Series)
without we comprehend teach the one who studying it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't be
worry Moduli Spaces of Riemann Surfaces (IAS/Park City Mathematics Series) can bring whenever you are
and not make your bag space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it in your lovely laptop
even phone. This Moduli Spaces of Riemann Surfaces (IAS/Park City Mathematics Series) having excellent
arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Janice Pyles:

Do you among people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on guys
this kind of aren't like that. This Moduli Spaces of Riemann Surfaces (IAS/Park City Mathematics Series)
book is readable by you who hate the straight word style. You will find the data here are arrange for
enjoyable reading experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you. The
writer connected with Moduli Spaces of Riemann Surfaces (IAS/Park City Mathematics Series) content
conveys prospect easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
articles but it just different as it. So , do you even now thinking Moduli Spaces of Riemann Surfaces
(IAS/Park City Mathematics Series) is not loveable to be your top collection reading book?

Mary Stock:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With reading through you can get a lot
of information which will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can easily share
their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their very own reader with
their story as well as their experience. Not only the story that share in the textbooks. But also they write
about the ability about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your kids, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve their
ability in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write to the book. One of them is this
Moduli Spaces of Riemann Surfaces (IAS/Park City Mathematics Series).

Danica Johnson:

The book untitled Moduli Spaces of Riemann Surfaces (IAS/Park City Mathematics Series) contain a lot of
information on the idea. The writer explains her idea with easy approach. The language is very clear and
understandable all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was authored by
famous author. The author provides you in the new era of literary works. You can easily read this book



because you can please read on your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book throughout anywhere
and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site in addition
to order it. Have a nice read.
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